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Abstract 

The study assessed the board of director’s effectiveness on the performance of loans in 
Tanzania. Four specific objectives guided the study as indicated by independent variables 
named board member’s independency, skills diversity, gender diversity and board meetings 
while loan performances measured by Non-Performing Loan (NPL) specified as dependent 
variable. Explanatory research design guided the study whereby the study selected sample of 
six (6) listed banks by using purposively sampling. The study found and concluded 
effectiveness of the board of directors is positive affecting performance of loans for listed 
banks through board member’s independency, gender diversity and skills diversity. The 
effectiveness of the board of directors on loan performance is negatively affected by board 
meetings. The study findings provide insights from a practical point of view on the board of 
directors’ effectiveness on the performance of loans in developing countries like Tanzania, 
thus filling the gap in the literature reviews. The study findings serve as guidance to 
regulators and policymakers on what set of factors to review and incorporate into policy, this 
will help the banks to achieve the current regulator’s requirement of NPL ratio of 5% or below. 
Apart from the study findings' having wider implications, the study has a few shortcomings for 
this reason, it would be noteworthy to extend this study to other latitudes incorporating even 
non-listed banks. This is because compliance of Banking and Financial Institutions (Corporate 
Governance) Regulations 2021 under BOT is mandatory to all financial institutions in 
Tanzania both listed and non-listed. 

Keywords: Dar Es Salaam Stock Exchange, bank of Tanzania, corporate governance, board 
of directors, non-performing loans 
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1. Introduction 

Bank plays a crucial economic function as an intermediary to channel funds from savers and 
depositors where by Ineffective corporate governance can lead to banks facing problem that 
can affect their performance and economy as a whole (Masulis & Cong, 2012). In banking 
sector, the effectiveness of corporate governance is critically needed to maintain higher level 
of public trust and confidence (Mori & Towo, 2017). Corporate governance affects the 
efficiency with which resources are allocated where by decisions about investments made by 
corporations are determined within the framework of their governance structures 
(Laoworapong et al., 2018). Boards of directors play a fundamental role in strengthening 
corporate governance by accomplishing the important roles of monitoring and advising on the 
provision of resources (Talavera et al., 2017). Board of directors is the internal governance 
mechanism that the bank could use to monitor and control the agency problem (Kim & 
Rasheed, 2014).  

Corporate governance in Tanzania associated with development of capital market to 
strengthen the mechanism of protecting minority shareholding. Despite the fact that good 
directives are in place through adaptation of global governance principles and tight Bank of 
Tanzania (BOT) prudential guidelines, banking sectors assets (loans) has been poetry 
performing. According to World Bank (2021), Tanzania Bank Non-Performing Loans to Total 
Gross Loans data was reported at 12.441% in 2017, a record an increase from the previous 
number of 9.608% for 2016. According to BOT (2020), the ratio of non-performing loans 
(NPLs) to gross loans in Tanzania decreased to 9.58% in 2019 from 10.51% in 2018 but was 
above the desirable level. Non-performing loans in Tanzania stood at 9.36% of total loans in 
March 2020, nearly twice the recommended threshold of 5% despite BOT measures to 
stabilize the banking industry, including merging small banks with inadequate capital (BOT, 
2021). 

The business of granting loans is subject to compliance of the respective bank’s credit 
policies & procedures that are approved by the board of directors. The credit policies & 
procedures in the banks are vital in guiding & governing the loan processes to ensure quality 
loans are granted by the banks. However, despite the presence of these policies & other 
approved controls to mitigate credit risk, the NPL ratio in the Tanzanian market has been 
above the threshold of 5% set by BOT hence calling into question the effectiveness of the 
board of directors on oversight of the bank’s loan performance. To address this research gap 
in Tanzania, the study investigated the board of directors’ effectiveness on loan performance 
in Tanzania.  

The remainder of this paper is organized as follows. Section 2 of the paper study consists of 
Literature review. Section 3 outlines the research methodology and specifically on target 
population and sample size, the sample selection criteria, source of data, variable 
measurement and references, data analysis and model specification. Section 4 consists of 
presentation and discussion of findings. The final Section 5 consists of conclusion and 
recommendations based on the research findings. 
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2. Relevant Literature Review and Hypotheses 

Our study has included an agency theory whose foundation will provide theoretical 
arguments on the board of directors’ effectiveness on the performance of loans in Tanzania 
context. The agency theory proposed by Jensen and Meckling (1976), which deals with the 
separation of ownership and control. Agency relationship is a contract under which one or 
more persons (the principal) engage another person (the agent) to perform a service on their 
behalf. If both parties are utility maximizers, there is good reason to believe that the agent 
will not always act in the best interests of the principal. The agency theory assumes that 
boards can perform their monitoring role better protecting interests of shareholders and 
minimizing the conflicts of interest between agents (managers) and principals (shareholders) 
when they are highly independent. Indeed, board meetings and diversified boards (such as 
gender or skills diversity) provide better monitoring (Carter et al., 2003).  

Theoretically, from agency perspectives a large proportion of outside directors on the board 
enhances board independence and safeguards owners’ resources from management conflicts 
of interest (Shleifer & Vishny, 1997). According to Kuzucu (2015), independence exists when 
a board member has never worked for the firm or its auditor and his or her employer does not 
conduct a substantial amount of business with the company. In order to effectively manage 
the CEO, a majority independent board of directors, rather than a board of dependent 
directors, is required. Lickerish-Rovers (2013) indicated that the presence of women might 
improve team performance, because more diverse teams may consider a greater range of 
perspectives and therefore reach good decisions. In particular, women directors seem to be 
severe controllers and provide strong oversight also on risk management, contributing to a 
more effective and better corporate governance (Mathew et al., 2016).  

In a nutshell, board diversity seeks to develop a diverse range of demographic traits and 
qualities in the boardroom (Adeola & Ikpesu, 2017). The board meeting is a medium set up 
for deliberations on key issues and matters amongst board members in order to make certain 
important decisions for the progress and growth of any organization. The diligence of board 
members is often measured on the board meeting attendance frequency by each of the board 
members. There is not slated governance law that determines the minimum number of 
meetings to be attended by a board member as it were to the best of our knowledge. This, 
therefore, means the control over board members individual diligence is internal and 
subjective to the chairman of that meeting. Increased meeting frequency promote idea sharing, 
performance disclosure, and debate to resolve agency problems. Prior research has indicated 
that frequent meetings improve the board member organization and communication as a part 
of the governance mechanism (Elamer et al., 2018). Skill diversity prepares the board for 
some of most pressing challenges that organization face. Knowledge and skills can enhance 
directors’ critical thinking that is essential in discharging their main roles of monitoring, 
advisory and providing important resources (Tricker, 2012). Some corporate governance 
studies, such as by Ujunwa (2012) found that board skill could have a positive influence on 
firm performance.  

Basing on agency theory and knowledge gap from empirical studies, the following null 
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hypotheses tested to attain study objectives: 

H1: There is a statistically significant positive relationship between board member’s 
independence and the performance of loans for banks listed at DSE 

H2: There is a statistically significant positive relationship between gender diversity and the 
performance of loans for banks listed at DSE 

H3: There is a statistically significant positive relationship between board meetings and the 
performance of loans for banks listed at DSE 

H4: There is a statistically significant positive relationship between skills diversity and the 
performance of loans for banks listed at DSE 

3. Research Methodology 

The study employed an explanatory research design. This research design was conducted in 
order to identify the extent and nature of cause-and-effect relationships between corporate 
governance attributes and loans quality for listed firms in Tanzania. The study used the 
quantitative approach through which secondary data were collected from firms’ websites, 
annual reports and audited financial statements to gather both corporate governance and loan 
quality data. 

The population consisted of all twenty-eighty (28) listed companies on the DSE as at 31st 
December 2021. Our study selected a sample of six (6) listed banks to examine the impact of 
the board of directors’ effectiveness on the performance of loans. The six (6) listed banks 
have been chosen out of the other listed companies from DSE as they deal with the lending 
business & regulated by BOT as far as NPL ratio is concerned and availability of data for ten 
(10) from the years 20112020. 

In our study, the board of director’s effectiveness presented by directors Independency, board 
skills, frequency of board meetings and board gender diversity represents independent 
variables whereas the dependent variable is Performance of loans. The study will employ 
NPL as indicator loan performance because it is a standard measure recommended by World 
Bank due to its cross-cutting implications to the economy and signifies the financial stability 
of banking institutions. 
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Table 1. Variables measurements and references 

s/no Variable Measure Reference 

1 Directors 

Independency 

Number of independent directors in a 

board 

Abiola et al. (2021), Bezawada and 

Adavelli (2020) 

2 Board Meetings Number of board meeting annually Yakob and Norraidah (2021). 

3 Gender Diversity Number of female directors Abobakr and Elgiziry (2017) 

4 Skills Diversity Number of board member with 

qualifications in accounting and finance 

Karkowska and Acedański (2019) 

Khan et al. (2021) 

Gupta and Mahakud (2020) 

5 Performance of 

Loans 

Ratio of non-performing loans per annum Birindelli et al. (2020) 

Source: Researcher, 2022. 

 

The study analysed data by using E View software version 12, where panel data regression 
model applied. Our study applied the panel data analysis because it provides more accurate 
inference of model parameters. 

Panel regression model specified as follows: 

Y (NPL) = ß0 + ß1(DI) + ß2 (SD) + ß3 (FM) + ß4 (BD) + ut        (1) 

Where 

DI = Directors Independency 

SD = Skills Diversity 

FM = Board Meeting  

BD = Gender Diversity 

NPL = Non-Performing Loans 

Ut = Error Term 

4. Presentation and Discussion of Results 

Board Independency have the largest standard deviation and sum of squared deviation, 
making it the most volatile variable. Variable with highest mean is board independency, 
which means on average board of listed banks are independent by 76% on average with 
maximum of 94% and minimum of 56%. This is due to BOT requiring two thirds of the 
board members to be non-executive members to promote independence as per the Banking 
and Financial Institutions (Corporate Governance) Regulations 2021 under section 5(1). This 
supports the hypothesis that there is a positive relationship between board independence and 
loan performance. Further from agency perspectives, a large proportion of outside directors 
on the board enhances board independence and safeguards owners’ resources from 
management conflicts of interest (Shleifer & Vishny, 1997). 
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Board meetings have a mean of 74% that means board of listed banks in Tanzania meets 
frequently with maximum of 100% meetings and minimum of 33%, BOT requires a 
minimum of 1 board meeting per quarter as per the Banking and Financial Institutions 
(Corporate Governance) Regulations, 2021 under section 35(1). Skills diversity of listed 
banks for boards in Tanzania has a mean of 39%, this means on average boards dominated by 
members with accounting, and finance careers by 39% which is very low compared to the 
demand of the industry in people of that skills with maximum of 88% and minimum of 13%. 
The BOT only compels the audit committee to have at least 2 members under the Banking 
and Financial Institutions (Corporate Governance) Regulations 2021 under section 9(2) hence 
the low number of board members with accounting or financial experience. 

Gender diversity has a mean of 27%, this means on average boards in Tanzania listed banks 
represents women by only 27% with maximum of 50% and minimum of 9% on individual 
board of banks. BOT does not compel banks in Tanzania to have female board Members, 
however for institutions that borrow capital from foreign institutions such as World Bank, 
African Development Bank and other international organizations; are motivated to increase 
the number of female board members and employees to achieve gender diversity.  

Most important loan performances have a mean of 7%, which means on average listed banks 
in Tanzania contributes about 7% on the level of NPL in the banking industry which is 
highest than the BOT threshold of 5% with maximum of 20% and Minimum of 1%. BOT has 
employed various measures such as hindering banks with NPL above 5% from issuing 
dividends and bonus to employees in order to encourage onboarding of quality loan portfolio 
hence promoting improvement of NPL in the financial sector. On normality distribution all 
variables have Jarque Bera P values greater than 0.05 to form normal distributions but with 
negative skew and positive skewness as well as kurtosis less than 3 for board independency, 
gender diversity, board meetings and skills diversity while loan performance has kurtosis 
greater than 3. All these normality distributions indicate the existence of outliers in the 
variable’s distributions. 
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Table 2. Descriptive statistics 

 Loan 

Performance 

Board 

Independence 

Gender 

Diversity 

Board 

Meetings 

Skills 

Diversity 

Mean 0.07 0.76 0.27 0.74 0.39 

Median 0.06 0.75 0.25 0.83 0.39 

Maximum 0.20 0.94 0.50 1.00 0.88 

Minimum 0.01 0.56 0.09 0.33 0.13 

Std. Dev. 0.04 0.09 0.08 0.21 0.17 

Skewness 1.25 -0.01 1.03 -0.71 0.29 

Kurtosis 4.54 2.49 4.97 2.49 2.38 

Jarque-Bera 21.66 0.65 20.28 5.74 1.80 

Probability 0.00 0.72 0.00 0.06 0.41 

Sum 4.05 45.61 15.92 44.17 23.59 

Sum Sq. Dev. 0.11 0.45 0.39 2.67 1.76 

Observations 60 60 60 60 60 

Source: E-Views 12 Data Analysis.  

 

The study was conducted to examine the board of director’s effectiveness on the performance 
of loans. Due to presence of heteroscedasticity and outliers in the normality distributions, the 
study recommends the use of fixed Effect Weighted least squares (WLS) regression since 
Hausman specification test p-value is greater than 0.05. WLS is a specialization of generalized 
least squares in which knowledge of the variance of observations is incorporated into the 
regression. Findings of the study according to Table 3 indicating Fixed Effect Weighted least 
squares (WLS) regression is statistically significant on explaining relationships between 
dependent and independents variables as indicated by R square (62%) and Adjusted R square 
(55%) which is statistical significance at 0.05 levels. This means adjusted R-square indicates 
62% of the variation on the dependent variable (loan Performance) explained by the changes in 
the independent variables (board member’s independency, gender diversity, skills diversity and 
board meeting).  

In contrary, the remaining 38% of changes on the loan performance explained by other factors 
not included in the model of this study. Mostly important standard error of the regression model 
is low (0.03) signifying that sample means are closely distributed around the population mean 
hence good representative of the population. SE of the mean (SEM) measures how far the 
sample mean (average) of the data is likely to be from the true population mean. The smaller 
the standard error, the more representative the sample will be of the overall population.  
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Table 3. Fixed effect weighted regression results 

Variable Coefficients Std. Error t-Statistic Prob. 

Board Independency 0.12 0.03 4.00 0.00 

Gender Diversity 0.07 0.47 0.15 0.04 

Board Meetings -0.04 0.01 -4.00 0.02 

Skills Diversity 0.13 0.04 3.25 0.01 

c -0.03 0.02 -1.50 0.20 

Effects Specification 

Cross-section fixed (dummy variables) 

Weighted Statistics 

R-squared 0.62 Mean dependent 0.07 

Adjusted R-squared 0.55 S.D. dependent var. 0.04 

S.E. of regression 0.03 Sum squared resid. 0.05 

F-statistic 9.01 Durbin-Watson stat 1.47 

Prob (F-statistic) 0.00  

Unweighted Statistics 

R-Squared 0.51 Mean dependent var. 0.07 

Sum squared resid 0.05 Durbin-Watson stat 1.3 

Source: E-Views 12 Data Analysis.  

 

To examine the board of directors’ effectiveness on loan performance in Tanzania; the 
following hypotheses were tested: There is statistically positive significant relationship 
between board independency and loan performance (B1 = -0.12, P-value < 0.05). This 
supports the hypothesis that there is a positive relationship between board independence and 
loan performance in Tanzania. This result support an idea that a large proportion of outside 
directors on the board enhances board independence and safeguards owners’ resources from 
management conflicts of interest Moreover, there is statistically positive significant 
relationship for both gender diversity and skills diversity and loan performance (B2 = -0.07, 
P-value < 0.05) and (B4 = 0.13, P-value < 0.05) respectively. This supports the hypotheses 
that there is a positive relationship between diversity (gender and skills) and loan 
performance in Tanzania. Our results support an idea that having more female directors in the 
board together with board members having accounting and finance skills can enhance 
directors’ critical thinking that is essential in discharging their main roles of monitoring, 
advisory and providing important resources Furthermore, there is statistically negative 
significant relationship between board meetings and loan performance (B3 = -0.04, P-value < 
0.05). This reject the hypothesis that there is a positive relationship between board meetings 
and loan performance in Tanzania. Our results suggest that board meetings are not an 
important dimension on loan performance. 

5. Conclusions and Recommendations  

The study was to examine the impact of the board of director’s effectiveness on the 
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performance of loans in Tanzania. Four specific objectives guided the study as indicated by 
independent variables named board member’s independency, skills diversity, gender diversity 
and board meetings while loan performances measured by NPL specified as dependent variable. 
The study found and concluded effectiveness of the board of directors is positive affecting 
performance of loans for listed banks through board member’s independency, gender and skills 
diversity. On the other hand, effectiveness of the board of directors is negative affecting 
performance of loans for listed banks through board meetings.  

Basing on the study findings, the followings recommendation provided by the study: the BOT 
should set a credit committee composition with members that have accounting or related 
financial management experience in order to harness maximum contributions from board 
effectiveness. Currently the Banking and Financial Institutions (Corporate Governance) 
Regulations 2021 under section 9(2) only requires the audit committee members to have 
accounting, auditing or related financial management experience while it is not mandatory for 
the credit committee members who are trusted with approving mandates for credit facilities 
limits requiring board’s approval. The BOT to continue ensuring that the majority of the board 
members are independent as an increase in independent board members has a positive impact 
on the performance of the loan, where an increase in independent board members led to 
decrease in the non-performing loans ratio. This will help the banks to achieve the regulator’s 
requirement of NPL ratio of 5% or below. 

Moreover, the boards of the commercial banks in Tanzania to increase the number of board 
members with a background in accounting and finance, despite the Central Bank only requiring 
two members of the audit committee to have accounting or related financial management 
experience. The commercial banks should consider increasing the number of board members 
with accounting or related financial management experience to improve performance of the 
loans as the members are vested with approving rights of credit facilities extended to customers. 
The researchers to use this study as a stepping-stone and to extend the study of board of 
directors’ effectiveness to other latitudes incorporating even non-listed banks.  

Apart from the study findings' having wider implications, the study has a few shortcomings. 
First, while there are multitudes of board aspects and loan performance, this study confined to a 
10-year period (20112020) and four aspects of boards (board member’s independency, skills 
diversity, gender diversity and board meetings), while Loan performance confined to NPL 
level. The variables selected, sample size, and time coverage provide sufficient observation to 
suit panel data analysis and generalization of findings. The most important selection of 
variables considers those studies conducted in countries related to Tanzania to a certain extent 
on the board aspects. This study was confined to six (6) listed banks in Tanzania and four 
aspects only of board attributes, for this reason, it would be noteworthy to extend this study of 
board of directors’ effectiveness to other latitudes incorporating even non-listed banks. This is 
because compliance of Corporate Governance under BOT is mandatory to all financial 
institutions in Tanzania both listed and non-listed.  
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