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Abstract 

Islam considers insurance or “insured” as a social phenomenon that was ormed by helping 
each other and humanity. Treasure gained after the death of a person as a result of a cause that 
by its nature will bring profit, which is done in the period he was still alive then the property 
as it was by Ibn Hajar al-Haytami, an expert from the Shafi'ites fiqh, in his book 
Tuhfatul-Muhtaj Syarah Kitab al-Minhaj (by Imam al-Nawawi), fall into the category tirkah 
treasure. Although the normative existence of insurance is a necessity in the communities in 
Indonesia but considering Indonesia as a Muslim majority country, then its existence cannot 
be released by the paradigm of the dynamics of the system of Islamic law. Therefore in this 
paper describes some of the approaches used in assessing the existence of insurance in 
Indonesia, it is not enough just to use the normative approach to Islam, but must be coupled 
with a conventional legal approach that is shaded by the science of law, especially 
constitutional law. 
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1. Introduction 

Every human being will have the name calamity, disaster either financially or physically. All 
the plight of man is the will of God, which cannot be prevented or avoided. However, the 
calamities that befall humans can be minimized the risk by planting many good deeds for 
others. Or by dividing the risk to a third party, in this case, the insurance. Sharing the risk 
with third parties is an effort to lessen the burden on families for the financial risks 
experienced. 

Attempts to minimize the burden of financial risk communities serve as an excuse to gather 
treasure, either save or registered to institutions that offer insurance. An effort is a form of 
anticipation, so that later when does death or illness happen to her children that they cannot 
watch anymore, minimal given the heritage to take care of various needs funerals, for giving 
the last of his parents, or for the cost of their care when sick. The inheritance parents are 
deceased's children (heirs) in Islam known as inheritance, which means that the next of kin 
inherited the treasures people who had died. 

Modern human life is so loaded with a variety of threats and hazards, triggered by the 
weaknesses, mistakes, negligence, and does not understand the difficult problem. Humans 
cannot know what he'll do tomorrow, and are not aware of the person on earth where he died. 
The Human each time faced with a series of dangers that threaten life, property, honor, 
religion and homeland.  

Prosperity on Earth can be realized by humans, if humans are capable of understanding and 
positioning of its existence on the rules that have been determined by his Maker, Allah. To 
understand and or prove it, then people need to do careful planning in living this life, this 
plan is not meant to fight destiny, but as a form of business or endeavor to anticipate the 
undesirable state, a step is the most appropriate one to follow insurance program.  

The nature of sharia insurance is mutual responsibility, cooperation or assistance and endure 
each other. Therefore insurance is allowed by sharia, because the basic principles of sharia 
invited to everything that resulted from the closeness of the fabric of our fellow human 
beings and to alleviate something catastrophic them as the word of Allah, in the Qur'an:  

“O you who believe! Violate not the sanctity of the Symbols of Allah, nor of the Sacred 
Month, nor of the animals brought for sacrifice, nor the garlanded people or animals, etc. 
[Marked by the garlands on their necks made from the outer part of the tree-stems (of 
Makkah) for their security], nor the people coming to the Sacred House (Makkah), seeking 
the bounty and good pleasure of their Lord. But when you finish the Ihram (of Hajj or 
'Umrah), you may hunt, and let not the hatred of some people in (once) stopping you from 
Al-Masjid-al-Haram (at Makkah) lead you to transgression (and hostility on your part). Help 
you one another in Al-Birr and At-Taqwa (virtue, righteousness and piety); but do not help 
one another in sin and transgression. And fear Allah. Verily, Allah is Severe in punishment.” 
(Al-Ma'idah : 2) or (5. The Table Spread with Food : 2) 

In the context of Indonesian life insurance Muslims, in particular, turned out to not only be 
able to accommodate the needs of Muslims against something suddenly occurred (e.g., death) 
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to get insured in the form of money or materials from the company. However, there are some 
other problems arising from the practice of insurance, among which are life insurance claims 
funding problems due to the death of someone from the aspect of their ownership status. 

Simply put, in the study of Islam can be understood as that fund insurance claim is part of a 
legacy (tirkah) should be divided among the heirs entitled to receive inheritance by law or 
agreement faraid each heir. In connection with the above description, there is one case related 
to the controversy forethought, i.e., as found in Supreme Court Decision No. 97 K / AG / 
1994 on insurance matters backgrounds their accidental injuries which PT. Prog provide 
accident insurance compensation to the heirs (deceased's wife) who by the heirs (family of 
the deceased) demanded the division of compensation because they considered as tirkah for 
shared inheritance. 

2. Status of Insurance Claims Fund in the Perspective of Jurisprudence 
Study insurance by this research is a life insurance claim funds that will be analyzed 
regarding assets to be acquired heir disbursed through claims because the product has the 
sixth death compensation benefits if the participant dies during the agreement. The 
participation of the participants regarding insuring themselves is an effort made to protect the 
financial risks will be experienced, especially in the case of death. Because as believed by all 
forms of life on earth, that death will surely come but do not know when it happened. 

Death compensation fund for customers of insurance (which could be called the policyholder), 
a major program to help alleviate the calamity that occurred on the insured, and insurance 
companies have joined the bank in trouble disburse the death benefit. The death benefit fund, 
derived from the money for the results obtained from the management of investment funds by 
the manager or insurer as the insurer. As noted in a book that “mudaraba is a contract for the 
property owner who handed over to another group to form a partnership for results.” 

So the fund is the absolute right of the grantor investment or insurance participants because 
the money is the money for the results obtained by the deal. And because of that mudharabah, 
Sheikh Abdul Wahab Khallaf allow insurance practice by stating that the insurer was 
permissible under the pretext that the insurance is mudharabah. Mudharabah in Islam is “an 
alliance agreement in profits, with capital provided by the parties and with the power of the 
other party.” 

For each client or policyholder who wanted to withdraw funds death, must submit a claim to 
the insurer, in this case, the insurance company that disbursed the money that has promised to 
the insured during his lifetime. And this filing can only be done by the heirs designated in the 
agreement or policy. 

For wakalah itself has been mentioned in various books, one of which is al-wajiz which states 
that “wakalah is the delivery, such as Amra wakkalatu ilaihi - I handed the assignment to 
him” and there syari'at also by Allah in the Qur'an 

Likewise, We awakened them (from their long deep sleep) that they might question one another. 
A speaker from among them said: “How long have you stayed (here)?” They said: “We have 
stayed (perhaps) a day or part of a day.” They said: “Your Lord (Alone) knows best how long 
you have stayed (here). So send one of you with this silver coin of yours to the town, and let 
him find out which is the good lawful food, and bring some of that to you. And let him be 
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careful and let no man know of you. (Al-Kahf: 19) or (18. The Cave:19) 

Thus, it is clear that the heirs designated in the policy are the belief that the deceased will be 
given a mandate by the takaful to get a death benefit fund. In addition to the designated heir to 
represent takaful as an insurer to distribute the gifts to the rightful heir if there are leftovers of 
the needs of the deceased, began to shroud until it snaps into the grave, paying off debt and 
fulfill the will of the corpse if any. 

3. Status of Claims Fund Life Insurance Ownership in Perspective PP No. 17 1965 
Discussion regarding the ownership of this insurance claim funds to first see provisions or 
rules contained in Law No. 33 of 1964 Jo PP 17 of 1965 as follows: 

a. Victims are entitled to compensation 

If any legitimate passengers of public passenger transport equipment which suffered personal 
injury, caused by the use of public transit, for travelers who are in transit in question, namely 
when rising from a place of departure to get off at your destination. 

b. Double Guarantees 

Public vehicles (buses) is on the ferry, when the ship in the intent accident, the bus passengers 
who are victims given a double guarantee. 

c. Victim whose body are not found 

Settlement of compensation for the victims whose bodies have not been found or lost based 
on the District Court. 

Determination of welfare money Prog equated with treasures which are already clearly part 
of each heir, so there is no different of the rights of each heir that could trigger conflict, 
means make it goal of establishing Islamic law to provide benefits, goodness, and pleasure 
for man, The benefits that can realized with the determination of the status of welfare money 
(fund insurance claims) Prog as inheritance, namely: 

a. Rights of the deceased's body on the cost of care is guaranteed because tirkah under 
Islamic law should put the cost of attention bodies. 

b. Rights heir was awake, because in Islamic inheritance law after the rights of deceased 
fulfilled the rest can divided among the heirs. 

c. Status clearer division inheritance for heirs because of the provisions in the life insurance 
heir accident according to Article 12 of Regulation No. 17 1965 sequentially as follows: 

1) Widows legitimate; 

2) In case there is no widow legal, his children were legitimate; 

3) In case there is no widow and legitimate children to the parents are legitimate. 

d. The benefits for the giver, the achievement of the purpose of administration, because the 
law of inheritance Islam requires, fulfill the rights deceased on care bodies, wills and debt 
repayments take precedence after the new wealth divided among heirs, and it is the goal of 
giving compensation that is for medical expenses and funerals as well as for experts the next 
of kin. 

Damage and ugliness that can avoided on the ownership of insurance funds, namely: 

a. Avoid quarrels among heirs, because the division is not clear. Because differences in 
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perception can sometimes be a trigger arguments. 

b. Prevent diversion of money donation by one of the beneficiaries. 

c. Preventing neglect deceased right to receive treatment remains, because in inheritance 
under Islamic law there are rights that must implemented are: first, care bodies, second, 
payment of debts, the third, the implementation will, before the inheritance has distributed to 
heirs. 

In addition to the above advantages, the determination of the status of the money (fund claims) 
Prog as inheritance also has shortcomings, namely: 

a. There is a possibility of rights take precedence while liabilities are forgotten by the heirs, 
since the determination of the compensation money Prog as inheritance is not positive law so 
that there is no sanction in the country of Indonesia, for those who violate them. 

b. If the deceased had a lot of debt, then the rights of the heirs can neglect. 

The conclusion that according to PP 17 of 1965, in case the victim dies, the death benefit is 
given directly to the legal heirs of the victim, namely: 

1) Widows or legitimate  

2) In case there is no widow authorized, the legitimate children 

3) In case there are no widow legal and lawful children, his parents were reasonable 

4) In case the victim dies has no heirs, to which organized the funeral given reimbursement of 
funeral expenses 

Then how to put the Government Regulation (PP) No. 17 The year 1965? Clear PP has 
formulated not oriented to considerations of fiqh, but then be applied to the Religious Courts 
as the place to use the legal rulings. Therefore, to find a form of it regarding fiqh, need to 
work longer to find its equivalent in a wide variety of causes in the study of fiqh ownership. 
Among the reasons, ownership fiqh is a gift and testament. By reading the sound of the 
Government Regulation apparently, does not qualify for a prize in fiqh in the real sense. In 
the PP affirmed that the insurance fund is insured damages. Compensation is clearly different 
from the title because in between there are fundamental differences. At presents, there are no 
losers, so it is not a substitute for something. Anything that will. 

4. Conclusion 
The concept of ownership of funds of life insurance claims in the perspective of 
jurisprudence and PP 17 of 1965 can compare and integrated. First, the comparison. Equation 
claim ownership of life insurance funds in the view of law and PP 17 of 1965 set by both in 
substance is the right heir of insurance participants or policyholders according to the 
provisions in the life insurance Islamic and conventional, both these heirs specified in the 
insurance policy or not specified in the insurance coverage as well as in relation to insurance 
soul because of a traffic accident. The difference in the rules PP 17 of 1965 to understand the 
hierarchy of ownership that the children are legitimate is not eligible to receive funds claim 
life insurance their parents if their widow living and form of compensation for the death of 
which the ownership is Individually not a collective, whereas in fiqh there are no hierarchy 
question and insurance claims fund holdings collectively instead of individually. 

Second, integration. The integration process is done by asserting and changing government 



Journal of Social Science Studies 
ISSN 2329-9150 

2017, Vol. 4, No. 2 

http://jsss.macrothink.org 198

regulations (currently in the form of Regulation No. 17 of 1965) that for the position of heirs 
who are not designated in the policy or PP 17 1965 have the same rights in matters of 
inheritance in the form of fund death benefits are disbursed through the filing of a claim, 
because the heirs designated only as a fiduciary (representative) on the recommendation (or 
no recommendation) of the deceased during his lifetime forget the fund from the insurance 
company. 

Through both of ushuliyah simple approach above, to achieve justice and welfare for families 
left behind, then the funds of life insurance claims should be accepted by one of the heirs 
(which in PP No. 17 of 1965 referred to his widow) as a fiduciary in a liquefaction a fund 
(insurance claims) and then distributed to the other heirs. 
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